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1. Galatians 6:7-9 - “Do not be deceived: God cannot 
be mocked. A man reaps what he sows.”

2. 2 Corinthians 9:6-7 - “Remember this: Whoever 
sows sparingly will also reap sparingly, and whoever 
sows generously will also reap generously.”

3. Luke 6:38 - “Give, and it will be given to you. A 
good measure, pressed down, shaken together and 
running over, will be poured into your lap.”

4. Matthew 13:3-9 - Parable of the Sower.

5. Proverbs 11:24-25 - “One person gives freely, yet 
gains even more; another withholds unduly, but 
comes to pover ty.”

6. Ecclesiastes 11:1-2 - “Cast your bread upon the 
waters, for after many days you will find it again.”

7. Malachi 3:10 - “Bring the whole tithe into the 
storehouse, that there may be food in my house.”

8. Philippians 4:19 - “And my God will meet all your 
needs according to the riches of his glor y in Christ 
Jesus.”

9. Proverbs 19:17 - “Whoever is generous to the poor 
lends to the Lord, and he will repay him for his deed.”

10. Matthew 6:19-21 - “Do not store up for yourselves 
treasures on ear th… For where your treasure is, 
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there your hear t will be also.”

– Principles (Laws) of Sowing and Reaping –

1. Law of Reciprocity: What you give will come back 
to you (Luke 6:38).

2. Law of Generosity: Generous sowing leads to 
generous reaping (2 Corinthians 9:6).

3. Law of Intent: Your hear t’s intention in giving 
matters (2 Corinthians 9:7).

4. Law of Timing: There is a season for sowing and a 
season for reaping (Galatians 6:9).

5. Law of The Soil: The condition of the soil (hear t) 
af fects the har vest (Matthew 13).

6. Law of Faith: Trusting God in your giving sets the 
stage for a har vest (Philippians 4:19).

7. Law of Multiplication: Small seeds can produce a 
bountiful har vest (Mark 4:30-32).

8. Law of Stewardship: Being faithful with little leads 
to greater oppor tunities (Luke 16:10).

9. Law of Blessing Others: Giving to those in need is a 
form of ser vice to God (Proverbs 19:17).
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10. Law of Abundance: God’s resources are limitless; 
He provides for those who give (Malachi 3:10).

– Additional Laws of Giving –

1. Law of Sacrifice: True giving often involves 
sacrifice (Mark 12:41-44).

2. Law of Joy: Giving brings joy to both the giver and 
the receiver (2 Corinthians 9:7).

3. Law of Community: Generosity fosters community 
and connection (Acts 2:44-45).

4. Law of Prayer: Pray for guidance in your giving 
(James 1:5).

5. Law of Consistency: Regular giving leads to 
consistent blessings (1 Corinthians 16:2).

6. Law of Trust: Trusting God with your finances 
opens doors for blessings (Proverbs 3:5-6).

7. Law of Humility: Giving with humility brings honor 
to God (Matthew 6:1-4).

8. Law of Ser vice: Ser ving others through giving is a 
reflection of Christ’s love (Galatians 5:13).

9. Law of Legacy: Your giving can impact future 
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generations (Proverbs 13:22).

10. Law of Gratitude: A grateful hear t leads to a 
generous spirit (1 Thessalonians 5:18).

– Continuing the List –

1. Law of Contentment: Being content with what you 
have fosters generosity (Philippians 4:11-12).

2. Law of Encouragement: Giving can encourage 
others in their faith (Hebrews 10:24-25).

3. Law of Wisdom: Seek wisdom in how and where to 
give (Proverbs 4:7).

4. Law of Accountability: Be accountable for your 
giving (Romans 14:12).

5. Law of Celebration: Celebrate the har vest and 
share the joy (Luke 15:10).

6. Law of Commitment: Commit your plans to the 
Lord (Proverbs 16:3).

7. Law of Preparation: Prepare your hear t and 
resources for giving (2 Corinthians 9:5).

8. Law of Openness: Be open to giving in unexpected 
ways (Acts 20:35).
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9. Law of Influence: Your giving can influence others 
to give (2 Corinthians 9:11).

10. Law of Faithfulness: God rewards faithful givers 
(Matthew 25:21).

– Additional Laws of Giving (Continued) –

1. Law of Purpose: Giving should be purposeful, 
aligned with God’s will (2 Corinthians 9:7).

2. Law of Abiding: Abiding in Christ leads to fruitful 
giving (John 15:5).

3. Law of Compassion: Compassion drives us to give 
to those in need (Matthew 14:14).

4. Law of Reflection: Your giving reflects your values 
and priorities (Matthew 6:21).

5. Law of Transformation: Generosity can transform 
hear ts and lives (Acts 20:35).

6. Law of Faith: Giving in faith can lead to miraculous 
provision (2 Kings 4:1-7).

7. Law of Intercession: Praying for others can 
enhance your giving (Ephesians 6:18).

8. Law of Diligence: Diligent planning in giving leads 
to fruitful outcomes (Proverbs 21:5).
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9. Law of Empowerment: Empowering others through 
giving can create lasting impact (Ephesians 4:28).

10. Law of Faithfulness in Little: Being faithful in 
small gifts prepares you for larger ones (Luke 16:10).

– More Laws of Giving –

1. Law of Par tnership: Par tnering with others in 
giving can amplify your impact (Philippians 1:5).

2. Law of Joy in Giving: Joyful giving reflects the 
hear t of God (2 Corinthians 9:7).

3. Law of Sacrificial Giving: Sacrificial giving often 
leads to the greatest blessings (Mark 12:43-44).

4. Law of Consistent Har vest: Regular giving leads to 
consistent blessings (Galatians 6:9).

5. Law of Unity: Giving can foster unity within the 
body of Christ (Acts 4:32).

6. Law of Testimony: Your giving can ser ve as a 
testimony of God’s provision (2 Corinthians 9:13).

7. Law of Joyful Receivers: Those who receive your 
gifts can bring joy to your hear t (Philippians 4:10).

8. Law of Spiritual Growth: Giving can lead to spiritual 
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maturity (Hebrews 5:12-14).

9. Law of Expectation: Expect a return on your 
investment in God’s kingdom (Luke 19:11-27).

10. Law of Comfor t: Giving can bring comfor t to those 
in distress (2 Corinthians 1:4).

– Fur ther Principles of Giving –

1. Law of Legacy: Generous giving leaves a legacy for 
future generations (Proverbs 13:22).

2. Law of Abundance: God’s abundance flows through 
generous hear ts (John 10:10).

3. Law of Open Hands: Open-handed giving invites 
God’s blessings (Proverbs 11:25).

4. Law of Restoration: God restores what is lost 
through faithful giving (Joel 2:25-26).

5. Law of Divine Provision: God provides for those 
who give (Philippians 4:19).

6. Law of Celebration: Celebrate the har vest of 
generosity (Luke 15:10).

7. Law of Discipleship: Giving is a par t of being a 
disciple of Christ (Matthew 28:19-20).
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8. Law of Accountability: You will be held accountable 
for how you use your resources (Romans 14:12).

9. Law of Seeking First: Seek first the kingdom of 
God, and all these things will be added (Matthew 
6:33).

10. Law of Selflessness: Selfless giving reflects God’s 
love (John 3:16).

– Final Laws of Giving –

1. Law of Peace: Generosity can bring peace to your 
hear t (Philippians 4:6-7).

2. Law of Encouragement: Your giving can encourage 
others in their faith journey (Hebrews 10:24-25).

3. Law of Wisdom in Giving: Seek wisdom in how you 
give (Proverbs 4:7).

4. Law of Vision: Having a vision for your giving can 
lead to greater impact (Proverbs 29:18).

5. Law of Commitment: Commit your giving to God’s 
purposes (Proverbs 16:3).

6. Law of Forgiveness: Generosity can lead to 
forgiveness and healing (Luke 6:37).
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7. Law of Par tnership in Prayer: Par tnering in prayer 
enhances your giving (James 5:16).

8. Law of Expectancy: Expect God to work through 
your giving (Hebrews 11:1).

9. Law of Impact: Your giving can have a lasting 
impact on others (Matthew 5:16).

10. Law of Openness: Be open to God’s leading in 
your giving (Acts 10:1-48).

– Concluding Principles –

1. Law of Faith in Action: Faith without works is dead; 
giving is an action of faith (James 2:26).

2. Law of Transformation: Generosity can transform 
communities (2 Corinthians 9:12).

3. Law of Holistic Giving: Give not just materially, but 
also with your time and talents (1 Peter 4:10).

4. Law of Celebration of Giving: Celebrate the act of 
giving as a community (Acts 2:46-47).

5. Law of Sowing in Tears: Sometimes giving involves 
pain, but it leads to joy (Psalm 126:5-6).

6. Law of Reconciliation: Generosity can help mend 
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broken relationships (Matthew 5:24).

7. Law of Divine Exchange: God exchanges our 
scarcity for His abundance (2 Corinthians 8:9).

8. Law of Sowing Intentions: Your intentions behind 
giving matter (Matthew 5:8).

9. Law of Building Up: Use your giving to build up 
others (1 Thessalonians 5:11).

10. Law of Mutual Benefit: Giving benefits both the 
giver and the receiver (Acts 20:35).

– Final Thoughts –

1. Law of Spiritual Gifts: Use your spiritual gifts in 
conjunction with your giving (Romans 12:6-8).

2. Law of Faithfulness: God rewards those who are 
faithful in their giving (Matthew 25:21).

3. Law of God’s Economy: God’s economy operates 
dif ferently than the world’s (Luke 12:15).

4. Law of the First Fruits: Honor God with the first of 
your increase (Proverbs 3:9-10).

5. Law of Joyful Ser vice: Ser ving others through 
giving brings joy (Galatians 5:13).
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6. Law of Abundant Grace: God’s grace empowers 
your giving (2 Corinthians 8:1-2).

7. Law of Trusting God’s Timing: Trust God’s timing 
in your giving (Ecclesiastes 3:1).

8. Law of Generosity as Worship: Giving is an act of 
worship (Philippians 4:18).

9. Law of Mutual Suppor t: Suppor t one another in 
giving (Galatians 6:2).

10. Law of Faithful Witness: Your giving can be a 
witness to others (Matthew 5:16).

– Conclusion –

These 100 Laws of Sowing and Reaping encapsulate 
the biblical principles surrounding the act of giving. 
Each law provides insight into how generosity aligns 
with God’s character and intentions, emphasizing 
that giving is a holistic expression of faith, love, and 
ser vice. The overarching message is that through 
giving, we can experience personal transformation, 
impact the lives of others, and ultimately bring glor y 
to God.

Written By Keith Joel Walker


